
 

Applicant Qualifying Criteria  

Aria at Idlewild LLC does business in accordance with the Federal Fair Housing Law as well 
as State specific Fair Housing laws. We do not discriminate based on race, color, religion, 
sex, national origin, familial status, disability, marital status, sexual orientation or gender 
identity. In order to ensure consistency, the following criteria shall be used in qualifying 
each applicant who is applying to live at Aria at Idlewild. 

 

Occupancy Standards: 

 The terms “occupant” and “occupants” include any lessee(s) and any authorized 
occupants / non-lessees. Unless otherwise determined by local or state municipal 
ordinances, the following occupancy standards shall apply. A maximum of two (2) 
occupants are allowed per bedroom plus one (1) per apartment home. All applicants must 
be eighteen (18) * years of age or older. A rental application must be completed for each 
individual eighteen (18) * years of age or older who will occupy the apartment. An 
application fee is required for each applicant. 

Guarantors:  

A guarantor will be allowed for applications that are accepted on a conditional basis for 
income only. A separate Guarantor application will be required. Applicants who are 
approved on a conditional basis will be required to pay an additional deposit or acquire an 
approved Guarantor. Guarantors will not be allowed for applicants who are denied due to 
credit or background screening. Guarantors must meet all criteria on their own in order to 
be eligible. 
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Income Verification:  

A minimum gross monthly income of 2 ½ times the monthly rent is required. 
Documentation must be provided to verify all forms of income stated on the rental 
application. The following forms of documentation are accepted to verify regular recurring 
income:  

• 2 consecutive pay stub(s) from current employer(s) which must be dated within the past 
45 days and must indicate the applicant's name, address, company name and gross 
annual salary to date.  

• Signed employment contracts, letters, statements of income or Verification of 
Employment Form. 

 • Most recent W2 or 1099  

 • Government documents detailing benefits (includes Child Support, SS Income, Alimony 
support.) Student financial aid report. If the applicant is unable to provide documentation 
of regular recurring income, bank statements can be used for income verification and the 
following conditions will apply: the bank statements must be in the applicant’s name and 
must reflect a minimum balance equal to or greater than two and a half (2.5) times the 
monthly rental amount multiplied by the number of months in the requested lease term. 

ID Verification:  

The following will be considered acceptable forms of identification and must be verified by 
all lease signers prior to keys being issued to the premises: Driver’s License, ID card issued 
by a federal, state or local government or a US Military ID or dependent card. This 
community utilizes an identity verification service. The service may contact you via text, 
email or phone to verify your identity as part of the application process. 
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Credit Scoring: 

 Aria at Idlewild evaluates each person applying to live at its communities with a credit-risk 
scoring system that is provided by an independent consumer reporting agency and 
consistently applied to all of Aria at Idlewild applicants. This scoring system uses a 
statistical model to estimate the credit risk that an applicant may not satisfactorily fulfill 
his/her lease obligations. The statistical model was developed from data regarding actual 
residents and their payment performance of their lease obligations. Prior to final 
acceptance of each applicant, Aria at Idlewild will use this system to provide a numerical 
score that represents a relative measure of the credit risk associated with each applicant. 
Each applicant’s credit-risk score will be compared to Aria at Idlewild’s acceptance 
policies to determine whether or not the applicant may be accepted. If your application is 
rejected based on your credit-risk score or accepted with certain additional conditions you 
will be given the name, address, and telephone number of the consumer reporting agency 
that provided the credit-risk score to Aria at Idlewild. An applicant who is rejected based on 
his/her credit-risk score, or accepted with certain additional conditions, may obtain a copy 
of the consumer report(s) on which the credit-risk score was based and may initiate an 
investigation to have any erroneous information contained in such reports corrected. The 
consumer reporting agency will advise you of the actions that you may take in order to do 
so. 

Criminal Background Screening: 

 Additionally, Aria at Idlewild conducts a multi-state criminal background search on each 
person applying to live at its communities. Our criminal background checks are processed 
using a sophisticated multi-state criminal records search system that objectively 
categorizes criminal conviction records based on offense type, severity of the offense, and 
the time that has passed since the conviction. If your application is rejected based on the 
discovery of public records that indicate an unacceptable criminal background, you will be 
given the name, address, and telephone number of the consumer reporting agency that 
provided the criminal background report. An applicant who is rejected based on such a 
criminal background report may obtain a copy of the report and may initiate an 
investigation to have any erroneous information contained in the report corrected. The 
consumer reporting agency will advise you of the actions that you may take in order to do 
so. 
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Renters Insurance: 

 All residents are required to obtain renter’s insurance from a carrier of their choice and 
each policy must meet the minimum requirements: At least $100,000 liability coverage. All 
persons shown on the lease must be shown as the “insured” party. The lessee’s complete 
address must be shown as the insured premises. Covered perils must include damage 
from WATER, FIRE, SMOKE and EXPLOSION. The policy must identify Insurance Tracking 
Services (or Aria at Idlewild), 15120 Idlewild Road, Matthews, NC 28104 as the “Interested 
Party”. This specification entitles your property to a 10–30-day notice of cancellation by the 
carrier. The effective date of the policy must be the move-in date or earlier and extend for at 
least twelve (12) months thereafter. 

 

 By Signing below, applicant acknowledges receipt of the Aria at Idlewild qualifying 
criteria.  

Applicant Name: _______________________________________  

Signature: ____________________________________ Date: ____________________ 


